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CITY OF AUSTIN
BID TABULATION
Beneficial Reuse of Biosolids

Solicitation No. IFB 2200 CDL2003REBID2

RX No. 18080100651
Opening Date:  9/4/2018
Buyer: Matthew Duree

Special Instructions: Offerors must use this Price Sheet to submit pricing for Category 1 "Required Pricing". Be advised that altering the Price Sheet and/or taking exceptions to any portion of the solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.

'The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual colume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantaties are provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage.

A "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response for Category 1 "Required Pricing" may be considered as a non-responsive Offer and will result in disqualification of the Offer.

Bids on the Prive Sheet shall be all inclusive, the Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping, hauling, or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to perform these services. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessaty to
perform the services required under this Contract.

'The City reserves the right to award a single Contract based on the lowest responsive Offer.

Receipt No. 1 2 3

Vendor Name Employee Owned Nursery Enterprises, LTD dba Organics "By Gosh" Texas Landfill Management, LLC Synagro of Texas-CDR, Inc

Local Presence (Y/N) NA NA NA

MBE/WBE N N N

CATEGORY 1 - Provide pricing for the following line items. The pricing provided for line item 1 will be used to evaluate "Price". The pricing provided for line item 2 will be used as required in emergencies only and will not be used to evaluate "Price".

EST | unir UNIT UNIT UNIT
ITEM NO. ITEM DESCRIPTION QTY PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE PRICE TOTAL PRICE
1 Composting and marketing of biosolids 110,000 | Wet Tons $19.60 $2,156,000.00 $14.53 $1,598,300.00 $13.93 $1,532,300.00
TOTAL BID FOR CATEGORY 1 $2,156,000.00 $1,598,300.00 $1,532,300.00

CATEGORY 2 - The information in this category will be utilized to vetify the minimum experience and qualifications outlined in Section 0500, Scope of Work of this solicitation. he following information shall be submitted within 3 calendar days upon the City's request or be
submitted with the Offer. The information provided for this category will be used to determine the Offeror's responsiveness.

Submittal Description

1. Provide a signed letter, on company letterhead, with the Offeror’s full name and address of the company and identify the parent company if you are a subsidiary. Indicate whether you operate as a partnership, corporation, or individual. Include the State(s) in which
incorporated or licensed to operate. Include the number of years of experience your company has in biosolids composting operations.

2. Provide a resume for the Operation Manager that will be assigned to this Contract. The resume shall include dates of employment, company names, position titles, and duties and responsibilities.

CATEGORY 3 -The City may have a future need to purchase additional related services and/or products under this Contract. Purchase of these services or products will be on an "as needed" basis at the prices offered in the list below (or you attach), and the City makes no
guarantee of purchase. List any additional services or products related to the Scope of Work. If possible, the City would like the Offeror to provide pricing for "Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and beneficial reuse at a TCEQ premitted land application
facility (offsite)" for emergencies in the field provided below (this is not mandatory).

Offerors may submit a separate document or price list for these other services or products in lieu of completing the fields in this category. At a minimum, the other document or price list shall include a description, unit of measure, and unit pricing. Or if you are providing a
percentage mark up or discount for the other services or products, the other document or price list at minimum shall include a description, the percentage, and indicate either "mark up" or "discount". All pricing, pricing documents, and/or price lists for this category must
remain firm and fixed during the life of the Contract.

Service or Product Description (if any) . . .. . . .. q 9 9.8
Unit of Measure Unit Pricing Unit of Measure Unit Pricing Unit of Measure Unit Pricing
Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and beneficial reuse at a TCEQ premitted land
application facility (offsite)-EMERGENCY ONLY Wet Tons $37.00 Wet Tons Wet Tons $38.79
Brush, Green Waste Grinding Service at Hornsby Bend for the City of Austin -
Per Ton $9.11

Award Method: By low price

Prepared By: Sheritta Nesbitt
Approved By: Matthew Duree
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City of Austin Purchasing Office — Log of Offers Received

IFB 2200 CDL2003REBID2  7/4 [ 18

Solicitation Number:  Beneficial Reyse of Biosolids

[:] IFB Disclaimer: The information contained on D RFP/RFQS Disclaimer: The contents of a proposal shall For more information, you may contact the Purchasing Office by:
the following bid sheets are for information only remain confidential until a contract is awarded. This log of Phone - 5§12-974-2500
alfld does not constitute actual award/execution offers is for information purposes only and does not Email - Purchinfo@austintexas.qov
of a contract.

constitute actual award/execution of a contract.

Physical Address - 124 W. 8t St., Third floor, Austin, TX 78701
Hours of Operation ~ Monday-Friday 7:45 a.m. to 4:45 p.m.

. . No Bid Read
Vendor Name (on sealed offer) Rec’d By _Date & Time Received Bid___Vendor Name (opening)* @ opening
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Form and Offers Distributed By: Date:

Form and Offers Received By: Date:
* Only complete if the vendor name is different from the name on the offerors documents inside the envelope that is opened during the webinar.




Section 0600-PRICE SHEET PROPRIETARY

CDL2003REBID2 - Beneficial Reuse of Biosolids

Version 1.1 8/16/2018
Vendor: Employee Owned Nursery Enterprises, Ltd. dba Organics "By Gosh"

Price Sheet Instructions: Offerors must use this Price Sheet to submit pricing for Category 1 "Required Pricing". Be advised that altering the Price Sheet and/or taking exceptions to any portion of the
solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.
The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The Ci

ty does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are
provided as a guide based on historica! or anticipated usage.

A "no bid" or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that itern. Be advised, a "no bid"
considered as a non-responsive Offer and will result in disqualification of the Offer.

or no response for Category 1 "Required Pricing" may be
Bids on the Price Sheet shall be all inclusive, the Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping, hauling,

or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges,
|mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to perfrom these services. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the service

s required under this Contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single Contract based on the lowest responsive Offer.

CATEGORY 1. REQUIRED PRICING
(o

ategory 1 Instructions: Provide pricing for the foliowing line items.
The pricing provided for line item 1 will be used to evaluate "Price".
The pricing provided for line item 2 will be used as required in emergencies only and willnot be used to evaluate "Price”.

Item No. Description Unit of Measure | Annual Estimates Unit Pricin Extended Pricing
1 Composting and marketing of biosolids Wet Tons 110,000 $19.60 $2,156,000.00
Total Annual Estimate $2,156,000.00
i Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and disposal at a permitted EMERGENCY
2 landfill (this price is in addition to the amount that will already have been paid to the Wet Tons ONLY $37.00
Contractor under line item 1).
A OR REQ RED = A

Category 2 Instructions: The information in this category will be utilized to verify the minimum experience and qualifications outlined in Section 0500, Scope of Work of this solicitation.

The following information shall be submitted within 3 calendar days upon the City's request or be submitted with the Offer.
The information provided for this category will be used to determine the Offeror's responsiveness.

1. Provide a signed letter, on company letterhead, with the Offeror's full name and address of the com
partnership, corporation, or individual. Include the State(s) in which incorporated or licensed to operate

pany and identify the parent company if you are a subsidiary. Indicate whether you operate as a
- Include the number of years of experience your company has in biosolids composting operations.

2. Provide a resume for the Operation Manager that will be assigned to this Contract. The resume shall include dates of employment, company names, position titles, and duties and responsibilities.
CATEGORY 3. INFORMATION ONLY-OPTIONAL ADDITIONAL SERVICES OR PRODUCTS
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PROPRIETARY

Category 3 Instructions: The City may have a future need to purchase additional refated services and/or products under this Contract. Purchase of these services or products will be on an "as needed"
basis at the prices offered in the list below (or you attach), and the City makes no guarantee of purchase. List any additional services or praducts related to the Scope of Workf possible, the City would
like the Offeror to provide pricing for "Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and beneficial reuse at a TCEQ premitted land application facility (offsite)" for emergencies

in the field provided below (this is not mandatory).

Offerors may submit a separate document or price list for these other services or products in lieu of completing the fields in this category. At a minimum, the other document or price list shall include a
description, unit of measure, and unit pricing. Or if you are providing a percentage mark up or discount for the other services or products, the other document or price list at minimum shall include a

description, the percentage, and indicate either "mark up" or

The information and pricing provided for this category wili not be used to evaluate "Price".

“discount”. All pricing, pricing documents, and/or price lists for this category must remain firm and fixed during the life of the Contract.

application facility (offsite)}-EMERGENCY ONLY

Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and bene

ficial reuse at a TCEQ premitted land Wet Tons $37.00
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Section 0600-PRICE SHEET

CDL2003REBID2 - Beneficial Reuse of Biosolids
Version 1.1 8/16/2018
Vendor: Texas Landfill Management, LLC

Price Sheet Instructions: Offerors must use this Price Sheet to submit pricing for Category 1 "Required Pricing”. Be advised that altering the Price Sheet and/or taking exceptions to any portion of the
solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual volume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided
as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage.

A "no bid” or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response for Category 1 "Required Pricing” may be
considered as a non-responsive Offer and will result in disqualification of the Offer.

Bids on the Price Sheet shall be all inclusive, the Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping, hauling, or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, mileage,
stop-fee, etc.) to perfrom these services. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to perform the services required under this Contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single Contract based on the lowest responsive Offer.

CATEGORY 1. REQUIRED PRICING

Category 1 Instructions: Provide pricing for the following line items.
The pricing provided for line item 1 will be used to evaluate "Price™.
The pricing provided for line item 2 will be used as required in emergencies only and will not be used to evaluate “Price".

Item No. Description Unit of Measure | Annual Estimates Unit Pricing Extended Pricing

1 Composting and marketing of biosolids Wet Tons 110,000 $14.53 $1,598,300.00

Total Annual Estimate

$1,598,300.00

Class B Blosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and disposal at a permitted landfill EMERGENCY
2 (this price is in addition to the amount that will already have been paid to the Contractor under Wet Tons ONLY $55.00
line item 1).

CATEGORY 2. REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
Category 2 Instructions: The information in this category will be utilized to verify the minimum experience and qualifications outlined in Section 0500, Scope of Work of this solicitation.

The following information shall be submitted within 3 calendar days upon the City's request or be submitted with the Offer.
The information provided for this category will be used to determine the Offeror's responsiveness.

P

Submittal De

1. Provide a signed letter, on company letterhead, with the Offeror’s full name and address of the company and identify the parent company if you are a subsidiary. Indicate whether you operate as a
partnership, corporation, or individual. Include the State(s) in which incorporated or licensed to operate. Include the number of years of experience your company has in biosolids composting operations.

2. Provide a resume for the Operation Manager that will be assigned to this Contract. The resume shall include dates of employment, company names, position tiles, and duties and responsibilities.

CATEGORY 3. INFORMATION ONLY-OPTIONAL ADDITIONAL SERVICES OR PRODUCTS

Category 3 Instructions: The City may have a future need to purchase additional related services and/or products under this Contract. Purchase of these services or products will be on an "as needed” basis
at the prices offered in the list below (or you attach), and the City makes no guarantee of purchase. List any additional services or products related to the Scope of Work. If possible, the City would like the
Offeror to provide pricing for “Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and beneficial reuse at a TCEQ premitted land application facility (offsite)” for emergencies in the field
provided balow (this is not mandatory).

Offerors may submit a separate document or price list for these other services or products in lieu of completing the fields in this category. At a minimum, the other document or price list shall include a
description, unit of measure, and unit pricing. Or if you are providing a percentage mark up or discount for the other services or products, the other document or price list at minimum shall include a description,
the percentage, and indicate either "mark up” or "discount”. All pricing, pricing documents, and/or price lists for this category must remain firm and fixed during the life of the Contract.

The information and pricing provided for this category will not be used to evaluate "Price”.

'HOW MUCH WILL YOU CHARGE THE CITY FOR THESE SERVICES OR PRODUCTS J

on (if any) (list g servicelitem balow)

—

Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and beneﬁa—al reuse at a TCEQ premitted land

application facility (offsite)}-EMERGENCY ONLY Wet Tons

Brush, Green Waste, Wood Waste Grinding Service at Horsby Bend for the City of Austin Per Ton $9.11
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ALTERNATIVE FOR CONSIDERATION

Section 0600-PRICE SHEET
CDL2003REBID2 - Beneficial Reuse of Blosollds

Version 1.1 8/16/2018
Vendor: Texas Landfill Management, LLC

Price Sheet Instructlonr Offerors must use this Price Sheet to submit pricing for Category 1 "Required Pricing". Be advised that altering the Price Sheet and/or taking exceptions to any portion of the
ion may jeop 1ce of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual velume. The City doas not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are provided
as a guide based on historical or anticipated usege.

A "no bid” or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on thet item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response for Category 1 “Required Pricing" may be
considered as a non-responsive Offer and will result in disqualification of the Offer.

|Bids on the Price Sheet shall be all inclusive, the Offeror shall not charge sep ly for admir , overhead, per diem, and shipping, hauling, or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges, milsage,
stop-fee, elc.) to perfrom these services, The Offeror shall provids all tools, labor, travel, and equipmant necassary to perform the services required under this Contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single Contract based on the lowest responsive Offer.
CATEGORY 1. REQUIRED PRICING

Category 1 Instructions: Provide pricing for the following line items.
The pricing provided for line item 1 will be used to evaluate "Price”,
The pricing provided for line item 2 will be used as required in emergencles only and will fiot be used to evaluate “Price”.

Item No. Description Unit of Measure Estl Unit Pricing Extended Pricing
1 Composting and marketing of biosolids Wet Tons 110,000 $16.99 $1,868,900,00
Total Annual Estimate| $1,868,800.00

Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and disposal at a permitted landfill EMERGENCY

2 (this price Is in addition to the amount that will already have been paid to the Contractor under Wet Tons $55.00

ONLY
line item 1).
A OR REQUIRED B A

Category 2 Instructions: The information in this category will be utilized to verify the minimum experience and qualifications outlined in Section 0500, Scops of Work of this solicitation.
The fallowing Informaﬂon shall be submitted within 3 calendar days upon the City's request or be submitted with the Offer.

The i provided for this gory will be used to determine the Offeror's mspomlvemss

1. Provide a signed letter, on company letterhead, with the Offeror’s full name and address of the company and identify the parent company if you ars a subsidiary. indicate whether you operate as a

partnership, corporation, or individual. Include the State(s) in which incorporated or licensed to operate. Include the number of years of experience your company has in biosoli: posting op

2. Provide a resume for the Operation Manager that will be assigned to this Contract. The resume shall include dates of employment, company names, position tities, and duties and responsibilities.
CATEGORY 3. INFORMATION ONLY-OPTIONAL ADDITIONAL SERVICES OR PRODUCTS
Category 3 Instructions: The City may have a future need to purchase additional related services andfor products under this Contract. Purchase of these servicas or products will be on an "as needed” basis

at the prices offered in the list below (or you attach), and the City makes no guarantee of purchase. List any additional services or products related to the Scope of Work. If possible, the City would like the

Offeror to provide pricing for "Class B Blosolid harge for gency P ion and b al reuse at a TCEQ premiited land application facility (offsite)” for emergencies in the field
provided below (this Is not mandatory).

Offerors mey submit a separate document or price list for these other services or products in lisu of completing the fields in this category. At a minimum, the other document or price list shall include a
description, unit of measure, and unit pricing. Or if you are providing a percentage mark up or discount for the other services or products, the other document or prica list at minimum shall include a description,
the percentage, and indicate sither "mark up" or "discount”. All pricing, pricing documents, and/or price lists for this catagory must remain firm and fixed during the lifa of the Contract.

The Information and pricing provided for this category will pot be used to evaluate "Price™.

Class B Blosollds surcharge for emergency transponatlon ad beneficial reuse at a TCEQ premined land Wet Tons
application facility (offsite)}- EMERGENCY ONLY

* Unit pricing shown in Item Number 1 above includes grinding services by Texas Landfill Management at Hornsby

Bend for up to 30,000 tons per year of brush, green waste, and wood waste from Austin Resource Recovery and
other City Departments.
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Section 0600-PRICE SHEET

CDL2003REBID2 - Beneficial Reuse of Biosolids
Version 1.1 8/16/2018
Vendor: Synagro of Texas-CDR, Inc

Price Sheet Instructions: Offerors must use ths Price Sheet to submit pricing for Category 1 "Required Pricing”. Be advised that altering the Price Sheet and/or taking exceptions to any portion of the
solicitation may jeopardize acceptance of your Offer.

The quantities noted below are estimates and not a guarantee of actual valume. The City does not guarantee the purchase of the quantities listed, actual purchases may be more or less. Quantities are
provided as a guide based on historical or anticipated usage

A "no bid"” or no response (space left blank) will be interpreted by the City that the Offeror does not wish to bid on that item. Be advised, a "no bid" or no response for Category 1 "Required Pricing" may b
considered as a non-responsive Offer and will result in disqualification of the Offer.

wr

Bids on the Price Sheet shall be all inclusive, the Offeror shall not charge separately for administrative, overhead, per diem, and shipping, hauling, or transportation costs (travel time, fuel surcharges,
mileage, stop-fee, etc.) to perfrom these services. The Offeror shall provide all tools, labor, travel, and equipment necessary to pedform the services required under this Contract.

The City reserves the right to award a single Contract based on the lowest responsive Offer.

CATEGORY 1. REQUIRED PRICING

Category 1 Instructions: Provide pricing for the following line items.
The pricing provided for line item 1 will be used to evaluate "Price”.
The pricing provided for line item 2 will be used as required in emergencies only and willnot be used to evaluate "Price”.

Item No. Description Unit of Measure |Annual Esti Unit Pricing Extended Pricing

1 Composting and marketing of biosolids Wet Tons 110,000 $13.93 $1,532,300.00

Total Annual Estimate]

$1,532,300.00

Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and disposal at a permitted
landfili (this price is in addition to the amount that will already have been paid to the Wet Tons
Contractor under line item 1).
CATEGORY 2. REQUIRED SUBMITTALS
Category 2 Instructions: The information in this category will be wtilized to verify the minimum experience and qualifications outiined in Section 0500, Scope of Work of this solicitation.
The following information shall be submitted within 3 calendar days upon the City's request or be submitted with the Offer.

The information provided for this category will be used to determine the Offeror's responsiveness.

EMERGENCY
ONLY

cription
1. Provide a signed letter, on company letterhead, with the Offeror’s full name and address of the company and identify the parent company if you are a subsidiary. Indicate whether you operate as a
partnership, corporation, or individual. Include the State(s) in which incorporated or licensed to operate. Include the number of years of experience your company has in biosolids composting operations.

2. Provide a resume for the Operation Manager that will be assigned to this Contract. The resume shall include dates of employment, company names, position titles, and duties and responsibilities.
CATEGORY 3. INFORMATION ONLY-OPTIONAL ADDITIONAL SERVICES OR PRODUCTS

Category 3 Instructions: The City may have a future need to purchase additional related services and/or products under this Contract. Purchase of these services or products will be on an “as needed",
basis at the prices offered in the list below (or you attach), and the City makes no guarantee of purchase. List any additional services or products related to the Scope of Worlf possible, the City would
{like the Offeror to provide pricing for "Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and beneficial reuse at a TCEQ premitted land application facility (offsite)" for
emergencies in the field provided below (this is not mandatory).

Offerors may submit a separate document or price list for these other services or products in lieu of completing the fields in this category. Ata minimum, the other document or price list shall inciude a
description, unit of measure, and unit pricing. Or if you are providing a percentage mark up or discount for the other services or products, the other document or price list at minimum shall inciude a
description, the percentage, and indicate either “mark up" or “discount". All pricing, pricing documents, and/or price lists for this category must remain firm and fixed during the life of the Contract.

The information and pricing provided for this category will not be used to evaluate “Price”.

Y

Class B Biosolids surcharge for emergency transportation and beneficial reuse
application facility (offsite)} EMERGENCY ONLY

Wet Tons $38.79

at a TCEQ premitted land

Page 10of 1



